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This is Service Design Thinking introduces an inter-disciplinary approach to designing services. Service
design is a bit of a buzzword these days and has gained a lot of interest from various fields. This book,
assembled to describe and illustrate the emerging field of service design, was brought together using exactly
the same co-creative and user-centred approaches you can read and learn about inside. The boundaries
between products and services are blurring and it is time for a different way of thinking: this is service design
thinking. A set of 23 international authors and even more online contributors from the global service design
community invested their knowledge, experience and passion together to create this book. It introduces
service design thinking in manner accessible to beginners and students, it broadens the knowledge and can
act as a resource for experienced design professionals. Besides an introduction to service design thinking
through five basic principles, a selection of individual perspectives demonstrate the similarities and
differences between various disciplines involved in the design of services. Additionally, the book outlines an
iterative design process and showcases 25 adaptable service design tools, exemplifying the practice of
service design with five international case studies. The book concludes with an insight into the current state
of service design research and sets service design thinking in a philosophical context. In collaboration with:
(in alphabetical order) Kate Andrews (UK), Beatriz Belmonte (E), Ralf Beuker (GER), Fergus Bisset (UK),
Kate Blackmon (UK), Johan Blomkvist (SE), Simon Clatworthy (NO), Lauren Currie (UK), Sarah
Drummond (UK), Jamin Hegeman (USA), Stefan Holmlid (SE), Luke Kelly (NL), Lucy Kimbell (UK), Satu
Miettinen (FI), Asier Pérez (E), Bas Raijmakers (NL), Jakob Schneider (GER), Fabian Segelström (SE),
Marc Stickdorn (A), Renato Troncon (IT), Geke van Dijk (NL), Arne van Oosterom (NL), Erik Widmark (S)
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From reader reviews:

Ann Davis:

The book This is Service Design Thinking: Basics-Tools-Cases gives you the sense of being enjoy for your
spare time. You may use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to be your best friend when
you getting tension or having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book This is
Service Design Thinking: Basics-Tools-Cases being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your
personal capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You can know everything if you like
wide open and read a book This is Service Design Thinking: Basics-Tools-Cases. Kinds of book are several.
It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this guide?

Ellen Omalley:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information
inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want feel
happy read one together with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular This is Service
Design Thinking: Basics-Tools-Cases is kind of book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Shannon Palmer:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this This is Service Design Thinking: Basics-
Tools-Cases reserve written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that may be
understand by anyone who also read the book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
publishing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still hesitation This is Service Design Thinking:
Basics-Tools-Cases as good book not simply by the cover but also through the content. This is one book that
can break don't ascertain book by its protect, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this kind
of!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to yet another
sixth sense.

Gilbert Phillips:

Some people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt it when they
get a half elements of the book. You can choose typically the book This is Service Design Thinking: Basics-
Tools-Cases to make your current reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading talent is developing
when you such as reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the opinion
about book and reading through especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to available a book and
learn it. Beside that the book This is Service Design Thinking: Basics-Tools-Cases can to be your brand new
friend when you're feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of their time.
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