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The Cleveland Way is one of Britain’s oldest long distance walks. The 100 mile route starts in Helmsley
skirting the western edge of the North York Moors National Park. On reaching the coastal town of Saltburn-
by-the-Sea, at its northern extremity, the path turns south-east and then goes down the coastal section of the
National Park, finishing up at Filey.

We’ll Have a Laugh is the amusing and well written story of seven Leicestershire lads who took it upon
themselves to walk the Cleveland Way during the Easter holidays in 1974. Follow the humorous and
sometimes challenging experiences of the intrepid explorers as they hike along the route and find yourself
immersed in nostalgia with well-known songs from the ‘glam rock’ era which intersperse the book. After
reading this book you too will be tempted and inspired to follow in the lads’ footsteps and walk this totally
unique route which combines moor and coast so successfully.
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From reader reviews:

Judith Rayl:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information
inside the book that improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of
guide you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with training books but if you want really feel happy
read one together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual We'll Have a Laugh is
kind of publication which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Lenora Hungate:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can
satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more time to be
read. We'll Have a Laugh can be your answer given it can be read by anyone who have those short extra time
problems.

Will Cathcart:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You
can choose the very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it.
It is named of book We'll Have a Laugh. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed
book, it can add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most significant that, you must
aware about reserve. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.

Garth McDonald:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by book. Many kinds of
books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these claims We'll Have a Laugh.
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