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Nearly 5,000 black Americans were lynched between 1890 and 1960. Over forty years later, Sherrilyn Ifill's
On the Courthouse Lawn examines the numerous ways that this racial trauma still resounds across the United
States. While the lynchings and their immediate aftermath were devastating, the little-known contemporary
consequences, such as the marginalization of political and economic development for black Americans, are
equally pernicious.

On the Courthouse Lawn investigates how the lynchings implicated average white citizens, some of whom
actively participated in the violence while many others witnessed the lynchings but did nothing to stop them.
Ifill observes that this history of complicity has become embedded in the social and cultural fabric of local
communities, who either supported, condoned, or ignored the violence. She traces the lingering effects of
two lynchings in Maryland to illustrate how ubiquitous this history is and issues a clarion call for American
communities with histories of racial violence to be proactive in facing this legacy today.

Inspired by South Africa's Truth and Reconciliation Commission, as well as by techniques of restorative
justice, Ifill provides concrete ideas to help communities heal, including placing gravestones on the
unmarked burial sites of lynching victims, issuing public apologies, establishing mandatory school programs
on the local history of lynching, financially compensating those whose family homes or businesses were
destroyed in the aftermath of lynching, and creating commemorative public spaces. Because the
contemporary effects of racial violence are experienced most intensely in local communities, Ifill argues that
reconciliation and reparation efforts must also be locally based in order to bring both black and white
Americans together in an efficacious dialogue.

A landmark book, On the Courthouse Lawn is a much-needed and urgent road map for communities finally
confronting lynching's long shadow by embracing pragmatic reconciliation and reparation efforts.
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From reader reviews:

Bessie Hall:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they are still students or it for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has various personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be compelled someone or
something that they don't would like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book On
the Courthouse Lawn: Confronting the Legacy of Lynching in the Twenty-first Century. All type of book are
you able to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Brian Seery:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or perhaps playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that's look different you can read a new
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent all day long to reading a
reserve. The book On the Courthouse Lawn: Confronting the Legacy of Lynching in the Twenty-first
Century it is very good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. We were holding
enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the
e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this
book possesses high quality.

Tia Rosario:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this reserve. This On the Courthouse Lawn:
Confronting the Legacy of Lynching in the Twenty-first Century is simple to develop you can read it in the
park, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not get much space to bring often the printed book, you can
buy the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. So there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Roberta Lawrence:

You can obtain this On the Courthouse Lawn: Confronting the Legacy of Lynching in the Twenty-first
Century by look at the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve trouble if you
get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by means of written or printed
but can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking by your mobile
phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more
information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still
upgrade. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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