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When Olivia Doyle’s father dies under suspicious circumstances, rather than inheriting a family fortune, she
inherits a new identity. She learns they were placed in the Federal Witness Security Program when she was
five years old. Her father was involved in an art forgery ring and testified against the mob. Brought up not to
trust anyone, Olivia has a difficult time relying on U.S. Marshal Ethan Ryder to protect her, and to keep her
secret. She fears her father may have continued his life of crime through her art gallery. She has little choice
but to depend on Ethan when she realizes someone is now after her. Olivia’s search for the truth leads her
and Ethan across country to a family and past she doesn’t remember.

At the age of ten, Ethan witnessed a brutal murder. He vowed when he grew up, he’d protect people in
danger. Protecting Olivia is difficult when she won’t trust him. He soon realizes his desire to protect her goes
beyond doing his job, but if his judgment becomes clouded by emotions, her safety could be jeopardized.

Can Ethan and Olivia learn to trust each other when they uncover secrets that will change their lives forever?

This is a new release of a previously published edition.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Marburger:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book entitled Identity
Crisis? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with the
favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have some other opinion?

Helen Turner:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a lot
of information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the guides. But also they write about the ability
about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids,
there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors in this world always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some study before they write on their book. One of them is this
Identity Crisis.

Ronald Searle:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, quick story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not seeking Identity Crisis that give
your entertainment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading behavior all over the
world can be said as the way for people to know world much better then how they react to the world. It can't
be claimed constantly that reading routine only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to be success
person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you are able to pick Identity
Crisis become your personal starter.

Kristen Blasingame:

A lot of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a book. They are directly felt that when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Identity Crisis to make your own personal reading
is interesting. Your current skill of reading ability is developing when you including reading. Try to choose
simple book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the sensation about book and studying especially. It is
to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the guide Identity Crisis can to
be your brand new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of the
time.
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