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At St. Stephen's Academy, the students are on the verge of revolt. While the younger boys plot an
insurrection, the older ones are preoccupied with sneaking out-of-bounds, thrashing each other, tearing each
other's clothes off-or some combination of the three. Morgan Wilberforce, for one, can't take it any longer.

Everything Wilberforce touches turns to disaster in his desperate attempts to fight off desire, boredom, and
angst. He knocks himself unconscious tackling the unattainable Spaulding on the rugby pitch, his headmaster
detests him for crimes committed years ago, and even his closest friends are subjecting him to physical
tortures normally reserved for juniors. When an accident at the boarding school leaves him with more
suffering than he could have fathomed, he finds himself alone and adrift. And the workaday charms of
cricket practice, Victorian pornography, canings from classmates, and fumbling with the pub-keeper's
daughter can only do so much to mend a broken body and a restless heart.

Stylishly inventive, H. S. Cross has crafted an imaginative, ritualistic world of men and boys narrowly
confined by tradition and authority. Wilberforce is an indelible portrait of a young man caught between lust
and cruelty, grief and God, frustrated love and abject longing-and a tour de force that heralds the arrival of a
brilliant new novelist.
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From reader reviews:

Jacqueline Kang:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled Wilberforce: A
Novel? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with your
favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have different opinion?

Jimmy Robertson:

The book Wilberforce: A Novel make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable
far more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem using
your subject. If you can make studying a book Wilberforce: A Novel to be your habit, you can get much
more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You
can know everything if you like available and read a e-book Wilberforce: A Novel. Kinds of book are a lot
of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this book?

John McCord:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading
book and so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of various ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, examining a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring that you imagine
the story how the figures do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to some others. When you
read this Wilberforce: A Novel, you can tells your family, friends and also soon about yours book. Your
knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a reserve.

Angela Souther:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book really can hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right
you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Wilberforce: A Novel
which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.
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