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What is a natural habitat? Who can define what is natural when species and ecosystems constantly change
over time, with or without human intervention? When a polluted river or degraded landscape is restored from
its damaged state, what is the appropriate outcome? With climate change now threatening greater disruption
to the stability of ecosystems, how should restoration ecologists respond?

Ecological Restoration and Environmental Change addresses and challenges some of these issues which
question the core values of the science and practice of restoration ecology. It analyzes the paradox arising
from the desire to produce ecological restorations that fit within an historical ecological context, produce
positive environmental benefits and also result in landscapes with social meaning. Traditionally
restorationists often felt that by producing restorations that matched historic ecosystems they were following
nature's plans and human agency played only a small part in restoration. But the author shows that in reality
the process of restoration has always been defined by human choices. He examines the development of
restoration practice, especially in North America, Europe and Australia, in order to describe different models
of restoration with respect to balancing ecological benefit and cultural value. He develops ways to balance
more actively these differing areas of concern while planning restorations.

The book debates in detail how coming global climate change and the development of novel ecosystems will
force us to ask new questions about what we mean by good ecological restoration. When the environment is
constantly shifting, restoration to maintain biodiversity, local species, and ecosystem functions becomes even
more challenging. It is likely that in the future ecological restoration will become a never-ending,
continuously evolving process.
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Spencer:

Ecological Restoration and Environmental Change: Renewing Damaged Ecosystems can be one of your
starter books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good
vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to get every word into pleasure arrangement
in writing Ecological Restoration and Environmental Change: Renewing Damaged Ecosystems however
doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource data that
maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information can easily drawn you into brand-new stage of
crucial imagining.

Joe Vizcarra:

This Ecological Restoration and Environmental Change: Renewing Damaged Ecosystems is great
publication for you because the content which can be full of information for you who also always deal with
world and have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it info accurately using great
coordinate word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can
have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Ecological Restoration and Environmental Change:
Renewing Damaged Ecosystems in your hand like finding the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous
one. We can say that no guide that offer you world within ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book already
do that. So , it is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?

Dawn Williams:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to examine a book. When
you learn a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and soon.
The Ecological Restoration and Environmental Change: Renewing Damaged Ecosystems offer you a new
experience in examining a book.

Daniel Hanson:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This Ecological Restoration and
Environmental Change: Renewing Damaged Ecosystems is simple to develop you can read it in the
recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not include much space to bring typically
the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save often the
book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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