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The new Cuban art grew up in the supercharged and conflicting currents of revolution, sometimes tracking to
its optimism and at others scalded by it. But even more than that it was an art with extraordinary relation and
relevance to the life of the country across social, domestic, cultural, and psychological registers: aggressive,
protean, and perennially restless within an extraordinary conviction about the possibilities of art.-from the
Introduction

In 1981, Volumen Uno, an exhibition at a Havana gallery, inaugurated a new chapter in the rich history of
Cuban art. Featuring an eclectic mix of works by eleven young artists filtered through a variety of styles-
informalism, Pop, minimalism, conceptualism, performance, graffiti, and povera-the art was a sharp break
with the past in both form and content. More of a phenomenon than a formal movement, the new Cuban art
was both a reaction to the sovietization of Cuban culture in the 1970s and the dynamic entry of a generation
of artists born around the Revolution and formed by its orthodoxies and its poetic idealism.

In this spectacularly illustrated volume, Rachel Weiss offers the definitive critical history of the new Cuban
art, exploring its remarkable artistic accomplishments and its role as catalyst for, and site of, public debate.
Weiss draws on two decades of engagement with Cuban art and on the statements of the artists themselves to
read individual artworks against the complex relationships between artists, their local and global audiences,
and the Cuban state.

Tracing the shift from the optimism of the early 1980s to the cultural cynicism that paralleled the near-
collapse of Cuban society in the 1990s, To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art identifies a renewed
idealism among the artists about the potential role of culture in Cuban society.
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From reader reviews:

Kim Scott:

Here thing why this To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art are different and reliable to be yours. First of
all looking at a book is good but it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as delicious as
food or not. To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art giving you information deeper as different ways, you
can find any guide out there but there is no publication that similar with To and from Utopia in the New
Cuban Art. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing in which
happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can easily bring everywhere like
in playground, café, or even in your means home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the
branded book maybe the form of To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art in e-book can be your option.

Benjamin Holmes:

This To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art are usually reliable for you who want to be considered a
successful person, why. The reason why of this To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art can be one of
several great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed
a person with information that might be will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring
it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed versions. Beside that this To
and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary,
giving you trial of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and revel in
reading.

Lois Huseby:

The particular book To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art will bring one to the new experience of
reading a book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to learn,
this book very ideal to you. The book To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art is much recommended to
you to learn. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Stephanie Carter:

This To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art is great e-book for you because the content that is certainly
full of information for you who always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This
particular book reveal it information accurately using great manage word or we can state no rambling
sentences included. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only
offers you straight forward sentences but difficult core information with splendid delivering sentences.
Having To and from Utopia in the New Cuban Art in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, details
in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no publication that offer you world inside ten or fifteen tiny right but
this reserve already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still
doubt this?
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