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This two-volume set teaches students about the early days of the slave trade and the contributions made by
Africans—both free and enslaved—to the greatest moments of American history. Students will learn about
the fight against slavery, the laws that made African Americans less than equal even after slavery was
abolished, and the continuing struggle for civil rights. The volumes also cover the many remarkable African-
American achievements in science, the arts, business, and popular culture.

The history of African Americans is rich, vast, and sometimes overwhelmingly complex for students
approaching the subject for the first time. This two-volume set begins with an overview essay of the
remarkable history of African Americans, from the earliest days of slavery to the stories, figures,
achievements, and continued struggles of the present day. An integrated timeline and A-Z section of key
events, issues, groups, and terms—including relevant court cases and legislation regarding African
Americans—clearly present significant historical aspects for students. Important primary source documents
are highlighted in sidebars throughout each volume. Special care is taken, particularly with older documents,
to excerpt enough material to contextualize quotes and make them more understandable, but not so much
material that young readers lose interest in a sea of daunting language. Unfamiliar terms are further
explained in call out boxes that define each term, and the terms are also supplemented by a glossary.

Volume 1: From Slavery to Freedom, 1492-1876

Volume 2: From Reconstruction to Today, 1877-Present

Set Features:

• 288 pages in 2 volumes

• 7 x 10

• 2-color interior

• 100 Photographs

• 40 Maps, Charts, and Graphs

• Sidebars and Fact boxes

• Timelines

• Primary Documents

• Glossary



• Index

Curriculum Themes:

• African peoples coming to America

• History of slavery in the United States

• Civil War and its impact on African Americans

• Segregation & civil rights

• African Americans today (struggles & contributions)

Reading Level: 6th-8th Grades
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From reader reviews:

Percy Brown:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know that
book is very important for us. The book Student Almanac of African American History (Middle School
Reference) seemed to be making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more
information. It is extremely advantages for you. The e-book Student Almanac of African American History
(Middle School Reference) is not only giving you more new information but also to be your friend when you
truly feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship with
all the book Student Almanac of African American History (Middle School Reference). You never truly feel
lose out for everything in case you read some books.

James Smith:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress. Some of
you maybe can update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know what type you should start with. This Student Almanac of African
American History (Middle School Reference) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Daniel Adams:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Student Almanac of African
American History (Middle School Reference) can be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know.
You are therefore out of date, spending your free time by reading in this completely new era is common not a
geek activity. So what these books have than the others?

Jose Rivera:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-book
technique, more simple and reachable. That Student Almanac of African American History (Middle School
Reference) can give you a lot of close friends because by you investigating this one book you have matter
that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to
get success. This e-book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than
various other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have Student Almanac of African
American History (Middle School Reference).
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