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Our Auntie Rosa is the most intimate portrait yet of the great American hero—"the lady who refused
to sit in the back of the bus."

     The family of Rosa Parks share their remembrances of the woman who was not only the mother of the
civil rights movement, but a nurturing mother figure to them as well. Her brave act on a bus in Montgomery,
Alabama, on December 1, 1955, was just one moment in a life lived with great humility and decency.

     After the deaths of Rosa Parks's husband and brother, her nieces and nephews became her only family
and the closest that she would ever experience to having biological sons and daughters. In this book, they
share with readers what she shared with them about her experiences growing up in a racist South, her deep
dedication to truth and justice, and the personal values she held closest to her heart.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Judith Jordan:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled Our Auntie Rosa: The Family of Rosa Parks Remembers Her Life and Lessons your brain will drift
away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can be your
mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a e-book then become one contact form conclusion
and explanation this maybe you never get prior to. The Our Auntie Rosa: The Family of Rosa Parks
Remembers Her Life and Lessons giving you one more experience more than blown away your mind but
also giving you useful info for your better life in this particular era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing
pattern the following is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished studying it, like
winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Michelle Johnson:

This Our Auntie Rosa: The Family of Rosa Parks Remembers Her Life and Lessons is great publication for
you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who have always deal with world and
have to make decision every minute. This book reveal it information accurately using great plan word or we
can say no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole facts in it.
Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but hard core information with beautiful
delivering sentences. Having Our Auntie Rosa: The Family of Rosa Parks Remembers Her Life and Lessons
in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no
reserve that offer you world with ten or fifteen minute right but this guide already do that. So , this can be
good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?

Eliseo Watkins:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to go through a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon. The Our Auntie
Rosa: The Family of Rosa Parks Remembers Her Life and Lessons will give you a new experience in
reading a book.

Coralee Lowe:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make someone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Often the



book that recommended for your requirements is Our Auntie Rosa: The Family of Rosa Parks Remembers
Her Life and Lessons this e-book consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. This
kind of book was represented how does the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer value to
explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some research when he makes this book. That is
why this book appropriate all of you.
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