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In the spring of 2010, Tabita Green's daughter, Rebecka-then in seventh grade-started to feel depressed and
lost a lot of weight. Almost immediately, Rebecka's well-meaning health care providers recommended that
she take an antidepressant (Zoloft) to "kick-start" the treatment process.

What followed was a year-long nightmare of the most unimaginable sort as Tabita and her husband, Todd,
watched their funny, bright daughter transform into a psychiatric patient. Rebecka was hospitalized
numerous times for suicidal ideations and psychosis-unable to function in the real world. Her psychiatrists
treated new symptoms with additional psychiatric medications, but instead of improving, Rebecka's health
deteriorated rapidly.

As the year progressed, the Greens started to question the wisdom of the dominant mental health care
system, which puts pills front and center, and eventually worked up the courage to ask the psychiatrist to
take Rebecka off all medications. Within weeks, Rebecka's suicidal and psychotic symptoms disappeared
completely. Now the family was able to focus on the real problem, her disordered eating. Rebecka was on
the road to recovery.

In "Her Lost Year," Tabita (with Rebecka) shares this intimate story of despair, recovery, and hope, but she
doesn't stop there. She goes on to describe what she learned about psychiatry in the US-especially related to
kids and teens-and discusses the ever-widening definition of mental illness and the culture of medication as a
first, rather than last, resort.

Subsequent chapters cover a wide range of effective, alternative treatment options from taking care of
physical needs to specific therapies including family therapy and dialectical behavior therapy (DBT),
therapies that helped Rebecka and her family heal.

In the last third of the book, the author ponders why so many people are struggling mentally and emotionally
in the first place. What if we could redesign our society for optimal mental health? What would such a
society look like? And what actions can we take now?

"Her Lost Year" is a must-read for every parent, caregiver, teacher, mental health professional, politician,
and community member who cares about children's mental health. Beyond inspiring hope and providing
valuable insight into children's mental health care, it offers concrete steps for how we can transform our
homes, our schools, and our society into environments that are conducive to mental health. It is a reminder
that many struggling kids are not "disordered"; they're simply trying to communicate that things are amiss-
and they are right. It's time we did something about it.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Leduc:

This book untitled Her Lost Year: A Story of Hope and a Vision for Optimizing Children's Mental Health to
be one of several books in which best seller in this year, that is because when you read this publication you
can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by
way of online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book,
because you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this
reserve from your list.

Raymond Phillips:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot
of information that may give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire all their reader with their story
or maybe their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about the
information about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors these days always try to
improve their talent in writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is
this Her Lost Year: A Story of Hope and a Vision for Optimizing Children's Mental Health.

Hazel Reinoso:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get wide
range of stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then
do you ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the
actual book you have read is Her Lost Year: A Story of Hope and a Vision for Optimizing Children's Mental
Health.

John Smith:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this book. This Her Lost Year: A Story of Hope and a
Vision for Optimizing Children's Mental Health is simple to develop you can read it in the playground, in the
beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not include much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the
particular e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone.
Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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