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This handbook is aimed at first-line health care providers involved in the perioperative care of adult and
pediatric neurosurgical patients. It is unique in its systematic focus on how to deal with common and
important clinical challenges encountered in day-to-day practice in the OR, the PACU, and the ICU and is
designed as a problem-solving tool for all members of the perioperative medicine team: trainees and faculty
in anesthesiology, neurosurgery, and critical care; nurses; nurse anesthetists; and physician’s assistants.

 

• Encompasses clinical continuum from neurosurgical pre-op to critical care – plus anesthesia in
neuroradiology

• Adult and pediatric care

• Structured algorithmic approach supports clinical decision-making

• Succinct presentation of clinically relevant basic science

• End-of-chapter summaries, with suggestions for further reading

• Collaborative approach and multidisciplinary nature of perioperative medicine emphasized

• Extensive summary tables

• Portable and formatted for quick retrieval of information

• Ideal for use in the OR, the PACU, and the ICU
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From reader reviews:

Guillermo Behler:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. Sure, by reading a publication your ability to survive increase then having chance to stay than other
is high. In your case who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this particular Essentials of
Neurosurgical Anesthesia & Critical Care: Strategies for Prevention, Early Detection, and Successful
Management of Perioperative Complications book as starter and daily reading reserve. Why, because this
book is greater than just a book.

Rocky Melvin:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the title Essentials of
Neurosurgical Anesthesia & Critical Care: Strategies for Prevention, Early Detection, and Successful
Management of Perioperative Complications suitable to you? The particular book was written by well-
known writer in this era. The actual book untitled Essentials of Neurosurgical Anesthesia & Critical Care:
Strategies for Prevention, Early Detection, and Successful Management of Perioperative Complicationsis the
main of several books that everyone read now. This particular book was inspired a lot of people in the world.
When you read this book you will enter the new dimension that you ever know ahead of. The author
explained their thought in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this
book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of
the world on this book.

Steven Strong:

You can spend your free time to read this book this guide. This Essentials of Neurosurgical Anesthesia &
Critical Care: Strategies for Prevention, Early Detection, and Successful Management of Perioperative
Complications is simple to deliver you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train as well as soon. If
you did not include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make
you much easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Vickie Flores:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library as well as
to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart and soul or
real their pastime. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time
there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know



that on this time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. So , this Essentials of Neurosurgical Anesthesia & Critical Care: Strategies for Prevention, Early
Detection, and Successful Management of Perioperative Complications can make you really feel more
interested to read.
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