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From New York Times bestselling author Mariah Stewart comes a novel of sexy romantic suspense for
fans of Nora Roberts, Catherine Coulter, and Karen Robards.

Former FBI agent Sam Delvecchio brings the keen skills of a profiler to his new position as a Mercy Street
Foundation operative–and not a moment too soon. His first assignment, the cold-case murder of a local soup
kitchen volunteer, has all the telltale signs of a serial killer’s work. That grim suspicion is confirmed when
FBI agent Fiona Summers shares the details of two other killings with eerie similarities to Sam’s case: The
bodies in all three cases have been carefully posed. And when a fourth victim is discovered, the two
investigators realize they’re pursuing the same twisted quarry.

Local parish priest Kevin Burch, Mercy Street founder Robert Magellan’s cousin, recognizes the posings for
what they are: The killer is staging the church’ s seven Acts of Mercy (“Feed the hungry, clothe the naked . .
.”) with the bodies of his victims. But as Sam and Fiona race to prevent the final three murders, taunting
messages from their target lead to the most chilling realization of all.

From the Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Jill Davis:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading addiction give you
lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book in
which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if
you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want experience happy
read one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The Acts of Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel is
kind of guide which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Sharon Clayton:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the title Acts of
Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel suitable to you? The book was written by well-known writer in this era.
Typically the book untitled Acts of Mercy: A Mercy Street Novelis a single of several books that will
everyone read now. That book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will
enter the new age that you ever know prior to. The author explained their plan in the simple way,
consequently all of people can easily to know the core of this e-book. This book will give you a large amount
of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world in this book.

Michael Lucius:

The publication untitled Acts of Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel is the book that recommended to you to read.
You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to a person. The language that publisher use
to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of investigation
when write the book, and so the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also might
get the e-book of Acts of Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free
time.

Manuel Pina:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its protect may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer could be Acts of Mercy: A Mercy Street Novel why because the
excellent cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or
content is actually fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to
pick up this book.
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