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Twenty-first century British kids are more comfortable with ethnic diversity than ever before. The 'mixed
race' population is rising exponentially. In school playgrounds across Britain, kids are inventing a version of
colour-blind, multi-ethnic interaction that should teach the adult world a thing or two - not least about the
amazing, superdiverse generation that is to come.
And yet, for over a decade, playgrounds and classrooms have endured unprecedented interference in the
form of official racist-incident reporting, training on the importance of racial etiquette, and the reinforcement
of racial identities. Such interference is viewed by modern day anti-racists as a necessary bulwark against the
creeping influence of the far-right, 'Islamophobia', and more generally the supposed covert racism of the
wider population. Many official policy documents written under the influence of this approach insist a failure
to tackle racist behaviour at the earliest age will allow racism to incubate and grow. Here, 'racism' is
something defined by the notion of what constitutes hate speech or wounding words. Often it can be detected
from an entirely innocent phrase, so long as the phrase is perceived by the offence-taker or another party or
policy as 'racist'.
This mindset has, in recent years, permeated public discourse on the subject. Evidence of racism - such as a
gaffe by a politician or celebrity, or a footballer's on-pitch insult - is always 'the tip of iceberg' (the moment
that racist society breaks the surface and is revealed to all). The idea of a hidden mass of racists in our midst
explains the advent of a racism-watch approach that turns up the attenuator and trawls the nooks and crannies
of everyday life for tell-tale signs. Moreover, PC anti-racism synthesises many of today's worst cultural
trends: the erosion of free speech and of adult moral authority; the elevation of victimhood and of identity
politics (particularly the reinstatement of racial identity); the misanthropic view of rotten, vulnerable
humanity (where the state becomes purifier); the cult of child protection and the emergence of a degraded
and vulgar conception of child development.
It is with some irony, then, that modern day anti-racism can be argued as having taken over from old-
fashioned racism as the dominant racialising force in British society.
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Daniels:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As it is
known to us that book is very important usually. The book That's Racist! (Societas) seemed to be making
you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages
for you. The e-book That's Racist! (Societas) is not only giving you considerably more new information but
also for being your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your e-book.
Try to make relationship together with the book That's Racist! (Societas). You never experience lose out for
everything in case you read some books.

Phyllis Belser:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your
free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The first thing
that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to consider look for book,
may be the book untitled That's Racist! (Societas) can be very good book to read. May be it could be best
activity to you.

Ok Lord:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, quick story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not seeking That's Racist! (Societas) that
give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading routine all over the
world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world considerably better then how they react to the
world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man but for all of you who
wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start examining as your good habit, it is
possible to pick That's Racist! (Societas) become your own personal starter.

Peter Beaton:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this That's Racist! (Societas) book
written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who
also read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate
your own personal hunger then you still doubt That's Racist! (Societas) as good book not just by the cover
but also from the content. This is one reserve that can break don't ascertain book by its cover, so do you still
needing an additional sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already told you so why
you have to listening to a different sixth sense.
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