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The third of five books in the groundbreaking new series The Human Equation Toolkit.

In Books 1 and 2 of The Human Equation Toolkit series, mime Wayne Constantineau and scholar Eric
McLuhan explore the four postures and the four modes of action. They show how the postures (standing,
lying down, kneeling, sitting) combine with the modes of action (isometric pressure, displacement,
configuration, articulation) to provide the basis of all developments in culture, science, activity, and media.

Now, in Book 3 of the series, they investigate the interplay between these modes and the modes of
perception. "Know yourself" becomes a journey that Socrates -- and perhaps even the Delphic Oracle --
never could have imagined: a sense-opening odyssey into the pathological and physiological effects of the
media -- or extensions -- of humanity.
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From reader reviews:

James Lindberg:

This Know Thyself: Action and Perception -- Book 3, The Human Equation Toolkit are reliable for you who
want to become a successful person, why. The key reason why of this Know Thyself: Action and Perception
-- Book 3, The Human Equation Toolkit can be one of many great books you must have is definitely giving
you more than just simple reading food but feed you actually with information that probably will shock your
preceding knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your
conditions both in e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Know Thyself: Action and Perception -- Book
3, The Human Equation Toolkit giving you an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you
tryout of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Marlon Duenas:

The actual book Know Thyself: Action and Perception -- Book 3, The Human Equation Toolkit will bring
one to the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the
event you try to find new book to study, this book very appropriate to you. The book Know Thyself: Action
and Perception -- Book 3, The Human Equation Toolkit is much recommended to you to see. You can also
get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Charles Shin:

You can spend your free time to study this book this book. This Know Thyself: Action and Perception --
Book 3, The Human Equation Toolkit is simple to bring you can read it in the park, in the beach, train in
addition to soon. If you did not have much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is
make you quicker to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when you buy this book.

Steven Barraza:

With this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you are related is
just spending your time almost no but quite enough to possess a look at some books. On the list of books in
the top record in your reading list will be Know Thyself: Action and Perception -- Book 3, The Human
Equation Toolkit. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in becoming
precious person. By looking upwards and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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