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We feel like parents in a fairytale turned to stone by a curse and condemned to stand like statues with our
hearts thudding in our chests as our son plays wild games, all alone in the palace. He sees us he knows us, he
expects us always to be in our right places - but he has no idea that we are human too.

David is eleven years old. He is happy, healthy and affectionate. He loves school, climbing trees and Disney
songs. But he's also profoundly autistic.Imagine being, like David, unable to speak more than a few words
and unable to express your most basic needs. He is oblivious to danger and blind to other people's emotions,
including the pleas of his parents. He is unaware of the chaos that he creates and is completely unmoved by
the heartbreak that he causes.

This extraordinarily moving account describes the heartbreak, and the unexpected joy, of autism. With raw
honesty, Christopher and Nicola Stevens lay bare their experiences, which are by turns harrowing, hilarious,
and inspirational.Autism is often depicted as a lonely affliction but, as David's story unfolds, his parents
reveal how the condition has given them an unbreakable togetherness; an insight into prejudice, as well as
kindness; an understanding of life without words or language; and an intense appreciation of their children.
Caring for David is an all-consuming experience...and through it they have learned, most of all, the meaning
of unconditional love.
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From reader reviews:

Alan Dean:

Here thing why this A Real Boy: How Autism Shattered Our Lives - and Made a Family from the Pieces are
different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it really depends in the content
of computer which is the content is as tasty as food or not. A Real Boy: How Autism Shattered Our Lives -
and Made a Family from the Pieces giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any
guide out there but there is no reserve that similar with A Real Boy: How Autism Shattered Our Lives - and
Made a Family from the Pieces. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your personal eyes about
the thing that will happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. You can actually
bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your means home by train. When you are having difficulties in
bringing the paper book maybe the form of A Real Boy: How Autism Shattered Our Lives - and Made a
Family from the Pieces in e-book can be your substitute.

Nannie Hernandez:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This A Real Boy: How Autism Shattered
Our Lives - and Made a Family from the Pieces can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know.
You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd
activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Jennifer Games:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is identified
as of book A Real Boy: How Autism Shattered Our Lives - and Made a Family from the Pieces. You can
contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could add your knowledge and
make an individual happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you
from one spot to other place.

Karen Taylor:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information coming
from a book. Book is published or printed or created from each source in which filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
looking for the A Real Boy: How Autism Shattered Our Lives - and Made a Family from the Pieces when
you essential it?
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