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In the pathbreaking tradition of Backlash and The Time Bind, The Conflict, a #1 European bestseller,
identifies a surprising setback to women's freedom: progressive modern motherhood

Elisabeth Badinter has for decades been in the vanguard of the European fight for women's equality. Now, in
an explosive new book, she points her finger at a most unlikely force undermining the status of women:
liberal motherhood, in thrall to all that is "natural." Attachment parenting, co-sleeping, baby-wearing, and
especially breast-feeding—these hallmarks of contemporary motherhood have succeeded in tethering women
to the home and family to an extent not seen since the 1950s. Badinter argues that the taboos now
surrounding epidurals, formula, disposable diapers, cribs—and anything that distracts a mother's attention
from her offspring—have turned childrearing into a singularly regressive force.

In sharp, engaging prose, Badinter names a reactionary shift that is intensely felt but has not been clearly
articulated until now, a shift that America has pioneered. She reserves special ire for the orthodoxy of the La
Leche League—an offshoot of conservative Evangelicalism—showing how on-demand breastfeeding, with
all its limitations, curtails women's choices. Moreover, the pressure to provide children with 24/7 availability
and empathy has produced a generation of overwhelmed and guilt-laden mothers—one cause of the West's
alarming decline in birthrate.
A bestseller in Europe, The Conflict is a scathing indictment of a stealthy zealotry that cheats women of their
full potential.
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From reader reviews:

Mildred Ortiz:

This The Conflict: How Modern Motherhood Undermines the Status of Women book is not really ordinary
book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book will be
information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual
read a lot of information you will get. This The Conflict: How Modern Motherhood Undermines the Status
of Women without we realize teach the one who reading through it become critical in considering and
analyzing. Don't end up being worry The Conflict: How Modern Motherhood Undermines the Status of
Women can bring when you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' come to be full because you
can have it inside your lovely laptop even telephone. This The Conflict: How Modern Motherhood
Undermines the Status of Women having good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not
sense uninterested in reading.

Eddie Patten:

The book The Conflict: How Modern Motherhood Undermines the Status of Women will bring one to the
new experience of reading any book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In the event you try
to find new book to see, this book very ideal to you. The book The Conflict: How Modern Motherhood
Undermines the Status of Women is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from
the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Peter Delaune:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look
different you can read a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply
read you can spent all day every day to reading a e-book. The book The Conflict: How Modern Motherhood
Undermines the Status of Women it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to
deliver this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from the
smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book features high quality.

Cheryl Crockett:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is created or printed or highlighted from each source which filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just in
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