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Develop robust modern web-based software applications and RESTful APIs with Laravel, one of the
hottest PHP frameworks

About This Book

Master the flashiest functionalities Laravel has to offer●

Use PHPSpec to design testable software by specification to ensure quality code●

Explore the best-practices and latest features of Laravel 5●

Who This Book Is For

If you are an experienced or a capable PHP programmer who has a basic understanding of the concepts of
modern PHP (at least version 5.4), this book is ideal for you.

Basic object-oriented programming and database knowledge is expected. You should already know your way
around Laravel, or have at least experimented with the framework.

What You Will Learn

Convert specifications into classes and functions, using a specification-based behavioral-driven design●

(BDD)
Create a deployment script for a continuous delivery environment●

Use Eloquent to interact with the database in an object-oriented manner●

Create RESTful APIs to allow an application to interact with other programs●

Easily scale software with route caching and the read/write configuration●

Use DocBlock annotations to enhance controllers and reduce the amount of code required●

In Detail

PHP continues to revive and Laravel is at its forefront. Laravel follows modern PHP's object-oriented best
practices and reduces time-to-market, enabling you to build robust web and API-driven mobile applications
that can be automatically tested and deployed.

With this book you will learn how to rapidly develop software applications using the Laravel 5 PHP
framework.

This book walks you through the creation of an application, starting with behavior-driven design of entities.
You'll explore various aspects of modern software including the RESTful API, and will be introduced to
command bus. Laravel's annotations package is also explained and demonstrated. Finally, the book closes
with a demonstration of different ways to deploy and scale your applications.
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From reader reviews:

Sophia Hartman:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent
all day long to reading a reserve. The book Mastering Laravel it is rather good to read. There are a lot of
those who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. If you did not have
enough space bringing this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book from
the smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book provides high quality.

Crystal Parrish:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its protect may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer could be Mastering Laravel why because the fantastic cover that make
you consider concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the
outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Shawn Howe:

This Mastering Laravel is great guide for you because the content that is full of information for you who else
always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it data
accurately using great arrange word or we can point out no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that
hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but tricky
core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Mastering Laravel in your hand like having the
world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no guide that offer you world
with ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs.
busy do you still doubt that?

Mark Guerrero:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This particular book Mastering Laravel was colorful and of
course has pictures on there. As we know that book Mastering Laravel has many kinds or category. Start
from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and feel that you
are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers you feel
happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading that will.
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